
CBC INCOME AND EXPENDITURE 937 

In the sound-broadcasting service, revenue from excise tax and broadcasting 
licence fees fell $393,620 short of the previous year's revenue from broadcasting 
licence fees and the former receiving licence fees. Commercial revenue for sound 
broadcasting also declined and operating expenditure increased by $1,241,696. 
The television service received $11,703,149 in excise tax collections. Commercial 
revenue for the year was $1,334,766 as compared to $518,380 for the seven-month 
period that this service was in operation during the 1952-53 fiscal year; expenditures, 
however, were $4,638,174 higher. 

A fourth loan for the television service amounting to $4,750,000 was authorized 
under Appropriation Act No. 3, 1953, and is to be amortized by 30 semi-annual 
instalments commencing Jan. 1, 1960. 

Capital expenditures during 1952-53 were $1,090,640 for the sound-broadcasting 
service. The principal expenditures were in connection with the Moncton, N.B., 
and Vercheres, Que., transmitters and the Winnipeg, Man., studios. Assets costing 
$65,360 were written off during the year. The sum of $3,323,974 was spent by the 
television service in developing production centres at Halifax, Montreal, Ottawa, 
Toronto, Winnipeg, and Vancouver. 

The CBC operates the International Service on behalf of the Government of 
Canada and all maintenance and operational costs are borne by the Government. 
These costs are not considered as chargeable to the CBC because the annual 
statutory grant and revenue from excise tax and licence fees are used only to serve 
listeners within Canada. Gross operating expenditure for 1953-54 exceeded those 
of 1952-53 by $45,235. The value of Crown assets in the custody of the Corporation 
increased $57,862 during the year after write-offs amounting to $9,004. 

7.—Income and Expenditure of the CBC, Tear Ended Mar. 31, 1954 
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